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Promises  for  Book 2 Thessalonians  
 

In chapter 1 of 2 Thessalonians, there are several promises of God that are highlighted: 
 
"We ought always to give thanks to God for you, brothers, as is right, because your faith 
is growing abundantly, and the love of every one of you for one another is increasing." (2 
Thessalonians 1:3) - This is a promise of God's transformative power, indicating that He 
is at work in the lives of believers, causing their faith to grow and their love for one 
another to increase. 
 
"This is evidence of the righteous judgment of God, that you may be considered worthy 
of the kingdom of God, for which you are also suffering" (2 Thessalonians 1:5) - This is a 
promise of God's justice, indicating that He will judge the wicked and reward the 
righteous with entrance into His kingdom, even though believers may suffer in this life. 
 
"when he comes on that day to be glorified in his saints, and to be marveled at among all 
who have believed, because our testimony to you was believed." (2 Thessalonians 1:10) - 
This is a promise of Christ's second coming and the glorification of believers, indicating 
that when Christ returns, He will be glorified in His saints and all who believed will 
marvel at Him. 
 
Overall, chapter 1 of 2 Thessalonians highlights God's transformative power, justice, and 
promise of Christ's second coming and the glorification of believers. 
 
 
In chapter 2 of 2 Thessalonians, there are several promises of God that are highlighted: 
 
"Let no one deceive you in any way. For that day will not come, unless the rebellion 
comes first, and the man of lawlessness is revealed, the son of destruction" (2 
Thessalonians 2:3) - This is a promise of God's sovereignty over the timing of Christ's 



second coming, indicating that it will not happen until certain events occur, including the 
revealing of the man of lawlessness. 
 
"And then the lawless one will be revealed, whom the Lord Jesus will kill with the breath 
of his mouth and bring to nothing by the appearance of his coming." (2 Thessalonians 
2:8) - This is a promise of God's ultimate victory over evil, indicating that Christ will 
defeat the man of lawlessness with His mere breath and His coming will bring an end to 
all evil. 
 
"Therefore, brothers, stand firm and hold to the traditions that you were taught by us, 
either by our spoken word or by our letter." (2 Thessalonians 2:15) - This is a promise of 
God's faithfulness to His Word and His desire for believers to remain faithful to the 
teachings that they have received. 
 
Overall, chapter 2 of 2 Thessalonians highlights God's sovereignty over the timing of 
Christ's second coming, His ultimate victory over evil, and His faithfulness to His Word. 
 
 
In chapter 3 of 2 Thessalonians, there are several promises of God that are highlighted: 
 
"But the Lord is faithful. He will establish you and guard you against the evil one." (2 
Thessalonians 3:3) - This is a promise of God's faithfulness and protection against the 
evil one, indicating that believers can trust in Him to keep them safe. 
 
"May the Lord direct your hearts to the love of God and to the steadfastness of Christ." (2 
Thessalonians 3:5) - This is a promise of God's guidance and provision of strength, 
indicating that believers can trust in Him to direct their hearts towards the love of God 
and the steadfastness of Christ. 
 
"Now may the Lord of peace himself give you peace at all times in every way. The Lord 
be with you all." (2 Thessalonians 3:16) - This is a promise of God's peace, indicating 
that believers can trust in Him to give them peace at all times and in every way. 
 
Overall, chapter 3 of 2 Thessalonians highlights God's faithfulness, guidance, provision 
of strength, protection against the evil one, and promise of peace 


